ITB 2015-002 DEBRIS REMOVAL

GROUP 1 GROUP 2 GROUP 3 GROUP 4 GROUP 5 GROUP ¢ GROUP 7 GROUP 2 GROUP 9 GROUP 10
4/2/2015 10:00 AM
CAN DO ENTERPRISES LLC 64,582.50 76,299.00 45,207.75 38,449.50 57,724.25{ 35,407.50{ 40,908.75| 12,150.00| 26,637.50 28,901.25
CERES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES 39,412.00 45,784.00 40,592.00 24,000.00 21,625.00| 26,040.00{ 24,250.00 3,080.00| 16,250.00 16,250.00
DAVID WHITE NGO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BiD 4,200.00( 20,700.00 29,300.00
DOWNEY TREES INC 16,800.00 63,200.00 67,200.00 23,520.00 43,890.00| 27,925.00] 41,450.00 5,500.00| 33,150.00 20,490.00
GEORGIA TREE 35,215.16 11,315.44 12,234.66 12,638.22 19,184.86| 34,049.32] 14,768.12| 33,825.12} 21,740.74 29,229.02
RUSSELL ENTERPRISES LLC 19,900.00 23,800.00 14,900.00 6,900.00 7,900.00 7,600.00 4,600.00 2,400.,00 ‘ 8,500.00 2,800.00
SOUTHERN DISASTER RECOVERY
TFR ENTERPRISES 90,895.20 63,539.52 33,657.36 49,338.96 84,971.04{ 57,934.80} 84,854.88 8,800.00; 37,374.48 39,668.64
ARBOR MANAGEMENT TREE SERVICES 45,991.00 54,861.00f 121,511.00 18,497.00 12,500.00| 26,670.00] 17,688.00 7,000.00f 21,923.00 10,000.00
* Bid was submitted in total and not in
accordance with the bid packet
instructions P
g [ 4

Patti Holder, Purchasing Agent

Witness




